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The National Cancer Institute José Alencar Gomes da Silva (INCA), a department from Health 
Ministry (HM), related to the Department of Health Care (SAS), is responsible for developing and 
coordinating integrated actions for the prevention and control of cancer in Brazil. It integrates 
strategic areas such as prevention and early detection, training of professionals, development of 
research and generation of epidemiological information. In the area of ​​technical-scientific 
dissemination, in partnership with the General Coordination of Documentation and Information 
(CGDI / MS) and the Latin American and Caribbean Center on Health Sciences (BIREME), INCA 
takes another step to develop the Virtual Health Library Prevention and Control of Cancer. 

To present the Virtual Health Library Prevention and Control of Cancer how tool to support 
research.

Currently, the databases comprise nearly 6.000 publications, including books, articles, 
systematic reviews, pictures health, theses, dissertations, legislation, conference presentations. 
These elements are essential, as extend research possibilities for use in the construction and 
analysis of policies directed to the health needs of the population.

The use of a modern approach for the management and dissemination of information 
strengthens research networks and the construction of new networks where people from all 
backgrounds can benefit in that sense the Virtual Health Library Prevention and Control of Cancer 
has been acting for development of teaching and training with them still in the training of users.

The project relies on partnerships among representative entities for the prevention and control 
of cancer in the country. The Virtual Health Library Prevention and Cancer Control adopt a new 
organizational model management in which information processing enables a better flow of 
scientific communication at national and regional level. Acting with the development of 
networks and advanced search strategies, allows the contents inserted are available with a 
dynamic retrieval to support the construction of new knowledge, determining efficiency with the 
use of sources of information on evidence-based medicine. 

 

Total production of the Virtual Health Library Prevention and Cancer Control, 2013

DATABASES : VIRTUAL HEALTH LIBRARY 

PREVENTION AND CANCER CONTROL TOTAL 

Publications (books, folders and brochure)
 

1789
 

Thesis

 

458

 

Articles

 

1852

 

Audiovisual (poster and presentations in scientific 

events)

 

795

 

Systematic reviews

 

670

 

Pictures

 

health

 

300

 

Legislation

 

More 400

 

 

 

 


	Página 1

